COUNTY OF PASSAIC
BID TALLY SHEET

Sherry Arvanitakis, Q.P.A. Straight Bids Nadege Allwaters, Esq.
Purchasing Agent County Counsel
Leslie Park, Esq.
Deputy County Counsel

Taken by: Darlene Morel

Taken by: Nichelle Tello PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
Typed by: Shantiece Durham

Bids received at 10:30 a.m. on February 27, 2024 at the Passaic County Procurement Center, 495 River Street Second Floor, Paterson. NJ 07524
SB-24-034 Milk, Dairy Products and Prepared Salads for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions

Ack Stmt. Non- Disc. /A Business
f C . . . _ .
Vendor Add(:enda o v(;:f:ar Cog'ff, Iran Reg, Cert. Avail to Co-Op Bid Total
A: $206,904.15 (17 Items)
Van Peenen Foods LLC B: $31,512.00
X X X C: $44,751.00
41 Hershey Road X X YES
W NJ 07470 D: $214,129.00
ayne E: No Bid
Grand Total: $497,296.15
A: $386,131.96 (30 Items)
. . B: $29,824.40
Mivila Foods ’
226 Getty Ave X X X X X YES C: $25,597.50
Paterson, NJ 07503 D: No Bid
’ E: $94,162.00
Grand Total: $535,715.86
A: No Bid
Cream-O-Land Dairies LL.C g gg gig
529 Cedar Lane X X X X X NO )
Florance, NJ 08518 D: $221,757.60
g E: No Bid
Grand Total: $221,757.60




VENDOR  |WINNING LINE ITEM

1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,11, 14.16,17,19,20,23,25,2
| 62829303334353637383940415
Mivila 16,97, 58,59,60,61,62,63,64,65,66,67

9,10,12,13,18,21,22,24,27,31 42,43,44.4
VanPeenen |5,46,47,48,49,50,51,52,53,54,95




(SB-24-034) Milk, Dairy Products and Prepared Salads for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions Master Spreadsheet

CONTRACT PERIOD: June 1, 2024 through May 31, 2025 with One-Year Option fo Renew
PHC: Prealmess Healtheare Center, OW: Meals on Wheels, CH: Gamp Hope

TTENTION VENDORS: Please include the product manufactures, product ID, unit price and total price. On the last page inciude the Total number of #ems bid” and the "Tofal amount of bid". Samples may be required prior to awarding of fine
ftems. Submission of samples shall be required to be deliverst to the app roptiate depariment, during their delivery times, within a reasonable period of time after you are notified to do so. Samples will ke at the sxpense of the vendor. No

samples shall be delivered prior to the bid opening. FAILURE TO SUBMIT SAMPLES, WWHEN REQUESTED, COULD BE REASON FOR REJECTION, Quantifies are estinates, they may be increased or decreased in any amount. Please referto
the Boiler Plate of this specification for more detafled explanation on quantities, Departments have requested that the item numbers identified in the bid, be included on the hvoice, so that they can check each delivery and insure proper

Billing. Part A wilt be awarded as a line ite

t bid. Part B,C, D & E will be awarded o one vender. Delivery time is 6:60 am to 100 pm.

SECTION {A) Line items 1 through 32 will be awarded as a line item bid
“ftem Descriplion Dept. Quantity Yendor Unit Price Total price Comments
1 Butter solids - 24 - 1 b per case PHC-62 MIVILA $ 128.86 | & 7,990.56 [36/1 Ib SOMMERWAID, 180701
62 cages CREAM-O-LAND NOC BID NOBID  |NOBID
, CH-10 VANPEENEN | $ 142,20 | $  8816.40 |SOMMERMAID 36HCS
2 iwhippad butter cups - 560 pleces per case PHC-750 MIVILA $ 38.16 | 5 29,192.40 |90 CUPS/eLB SOMMERMAID, 120708
o i | RO el |5 " %000 | s s0e0000 onwexes cos
90 cups pes pound CH-15 VANPEENEN . . ;
3 [Margarine solids - 30 - 1 i per case PHC-100 MViLA | $ 38.75 | § 3,875.00 [SUPER CHEF, 180900
100 cases § CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BIiD [NOBID
L VANPEENEN | % 42,0018  4,200.00 |ALPINE VALLEY
4 |Cottage cheese, large curd, 5 Ib. container PHC-200 MIVILA $ 890 | $ 4.780.00 {C-0-, 191901
200 each CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NCBID |NOBID
VANPEENEN | § 11501 $ 2,300.00 ;:CABOT
g |Sour cream, 5 th. container PHC-T5 MIVILA L 825 % 618.75 [C-O-L, 191800
75 each CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
, VANPEENEN 1 3 9.50 | $ 712.50 [CABOT
6 |Light whipped cream, 14 oz. can, sweetened, PHC-40 WMIVILA % 3770 | $ 1,885.00 |12/150Z, 191905
50 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
12 canslcase VANPEENEN § $ 420018 2,100.00 {ROSENBERGER
=7 {Sour cream, mdwidual serving, 100/case PHCA00 MIVILA $ 5700 | $  2.233.80 |100/10Z, 191504
102 cases ¢ CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
| 1 oz portions CH-2 VANPEENEN NO BID NORID INOBID
8  lCream cheese, individual serving, 100/case PHC-200 MIVILA $ 26905 | § 5,497.80 |100/10Z, 190310
204 cases | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NORID [NOBID
. 1 oz porions CH-4 VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID NGO BID
9 1Butter blend solids - 36 per case FHC-100 MIVILA % 50.70 | $ 5,070.00 [30/1LB, ADMIRATION, 190715
106 cases | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID  |[NOBID
| pound porfion VANPEENEN | $ 45001 % 4,500.00 |ALPINE VALLEY, 30#/CASE
10 |Salad , macareni 1730 1b Sally Sherman 11230 or PHC-7260 1bs MIVILA $2.79/L8 $ 20,590.20 |30LB, SALLY SHERMAN, 650711
7380 Ibs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID [NOBID
equal CH-120LBS VANPEENEN | § 2.50 | § 18,450.00 ISALLY SHERMAN




11 |Salad, pasta supreme, 4/30 Ib Sally Sherman 1865 PHC-500 tbs MIVILA $4.95LB $ 2,475.00 {518, DAVES, 650718
500 Ibs CREAM-O-LAND NO BiD NOBID [NOBID
or equal VANPEENEN NC BID NO BID NG BID
12 |Salad, cole slaw, 1/30 Ib Sally Sherman 1130 PHC-8080 [os MIVILA $2790B | $ 25612.20 |30LB, SALLY SHERMAN, 660708
9180 |bs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID NO BID
or equal CH-120LBS VANPEENEN | $ 250 | $ 22,950.00 |SALLY SHERMAN
13 {Salad, potato, 1730 I, Sally Sherman 1330 PHC-4860 [bs MIVILA $2.79/LB $ 13,804.20 [30LB, SALLY SHERMAN, 850707
4980 lbs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
ar equal CH-120LBS VANPEENEN | § 250 | § 12,450.00 {SALLY SHERMAN
14 [Salad, German potaio,2/8 1b Sally Sherman 1810 PHC-1200 1bs MIVILA $3.09/LB §  2,708.00 |2/8LB, SALLY SHERMAN, 650720
1200 Ibs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
or squal VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID [NOBID
15 [Salad, cucumber, 2/8 Ib, Sally Sherman 1840 PHC-750 Ibs MIVILA NO BID NOBID |NOBD
750 lbs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID (NOBID
or equal VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID |[NOBID
16 [Salad, potato, red 218 Ib, Sally Sherman 1§25 PHC-750 Ibs MHVILA 3.89/.B ¢ 2,917.50 |5LB, DAVES, 650702
750 s CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID INOBID
or equal VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID |NOBID
17 |3 Ib. Cream cheese PHC-10 WMIVILA $ 894 1% $0.40 |3LE, 190305
10 each CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NOBID {NCBID
VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID  [NOBID
18 lice Tea, § oz PHC-0 MIVILA $ 27851 % 1,671.00 |CLOVER 30/160Z
60 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID  |[NOBID
CH-10 VANPEENEN | § 1650 | § 990.00 |HARRISBURG, 50/CS
19 |Orange juice, quart size PHC-25 MIVILA $ 5875 5 1,468.75 1241 QUART
25 cases CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NOEID [NOBID
VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID |[NOBD
20 IHeavy cream, yuart size PHC-50 WIVILA % 4981 % 298.80 {1QT, C-0-L, 191812
60 each CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
CH-1G VANPEENEN | 3 B501 S 350.00 |ROSENBERGER
21 [Half & Half, guart size PHC-160 MIVILA ] 2081 % E51.30 |1QT, C-0-L, 181822
185 each CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOEBID [NOBID
L CH-25 VANPEENEN |5 2.65¢ 49025 |ROSENBERGER
22 |Half & Helf, PC creamer PHC-500 MIVILA 3 1705 | § 5,334.00 {C-0-L, 161820
520 cases | CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NOBID [NOBID
CH-20 VANPEENEN | § 14501 % 7,540.00 {ROSENBERGER
2z |Egg Nog, gquart PHC-100 : MIVILA $ 459 % 573.75 |CG-0-L, 450120
125 quarts | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
CH-25 VANPEENEN NO BiD NOBID |NCBID
24 |Engs, large, 30 dozen per cage PHC-200 203 cases MIVILA $ 107.70 | $ 21,863.10 [191103
CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NORBID |NOBID
CH-3 VANPEENEN | § 105.00 | § 21,315.00




5 |Frozen Liguid Whole Eggs, 30 Ib Pail PHC- 380 350 each MIVILA $ 53.70 | $ 18,795.00 |6/5LE, 830505
CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |[NOBID
. VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID NO BID
% (Frozen Liquid Egg Whites, 30 Ibs Pail PHC -350 350 each MIVILA $ 5670 | $ 19,845.00 |6/5LE, 930506
CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID  |NGBID
L VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID |[NOBID
7 {Lactaid mik, 8 oz., 20/case PHC-1200 . MIVILA $ 40.85 | § 58,820.00 |50/80Z, C-0-L., 450484
1200 ases | CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ VANPEENEN § § 2500 | § 34,300.00 |ROSENBERGER 50/C3
8 |Almond Mitk, Shelf Stablg, Boz., 18 per case PHC-B30 MIVILA $ 33.85 | § 31,480.50 |18/80Z, SILK VANILLA OR CHOGOLATE, 450303
930 case CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID [NCBID
| ‘ VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID [INOBID
29 ISoy Milk, Shelf Stable, 8 oz 12 per case PHC-1380 MIVILA $ 31.85 | $ 43,953.00 |6/320Z, SILK
1380 case | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID INOBID
. VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID _ |NOBID
Italian Ice Cup, Lemon, 4 oz, 72 per case PHC-7 MIVILA $ 1685 § 117.95 |12/602, MARINO'S, 871068
S0 7 Cases CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NO BID NQ BID
_ VANPEENEN NO BID NOBID  [NOBID
31 |8 oz Chocolate Mills, 27 per case PHC-1400 MIVILA $ 3455 | $ 4B,930.00 (70/80Z, C-O-L, 450452
1400 case CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NQ BID NO BID
VANPEENEN $ 2450 | § 34,300.00 [HARRISBURG, 50/CS
32 |American Cheess, Vegan, 32 slices per b PHC-200 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NO BID
200 lbs CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID |NOBID
SECTION (B) Line items 33 through 41 will be awarded as a "lump sum bid" to one vendor. Vendor must bid ail items.
33 PHG-50 HivILA $ 57.80 | § 2,890.00 A5, SOMMERMAID, 1621386
Cheddar cheese, shredded, 5 Ib bag, 20 Ibs. per case 50 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NoBD  |NO BID
VANPEENEN $ ___?G.D{J g 3,000.00 |LAKEWOOD
“34  |Chedder cheese, sharp, yellow, 10 b, loaf PHC-750 Ibs WMIVILA $3.791L.8 % 2,842.50 |2/5LB, CWT DNRBL, 192112
750ks | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
VANPEENEN | $ 3.89 | $  2,817.50 ILAUBSCHER
—a5  |American cheese, vellow, 160 slices per § 1b. PHC-4000 MIVILA $3.19/LE % 12,760.00 [4/5LB, UNIQUE, 190104
4000 {bs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID [NOBID
. steeve, 20 Ibs. per cage VANPEENEN |3 335 | $ 13,400.00 [BONGARD
36 iMuenster cheese, 5 Ib. Joaf PHC-800 MIVILA $3.59/LB $  1,795.00 |[CWT, SOMMERMAID, 182120
500 lbs CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NOBID  [NOBID
VANPEENEN [ § 365|% 1,825.00 [CABOT
37 PHC-1200 MIVILA $3.39/LB $  4,271.40 4/5LB, BELLA, 192127
Mozzarrella cheese, shredded, 5 Ib. bag, 30 {bs.fcase 1260 Ibs CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NOBID  [NCBID
. CH-B0LBS VANPEENEN | $ 255 % 4,473.00 [JACOBC




“Trroszarrella choese, 5 Ib. loaf PrC-300 WIVILA $339/LE |$ 1,017.00 [CWT, BELLA, 102104
3001bs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID  |[NOBID
VANPEENEN R 33015 990.00 |JACCBO
Swiss cheese, 16 b, loaf PHC-750 MIVILA $3.5808 % - 2,602.50 [CWT, BLOCK ESSENTIALS, 191503
750 tbs CREAM-O-LAND NQEBID NORID [NOBID
VANPEENEN $ 3958 296250 |LAKENOOD
Provolone cheese, 10 1o, Joaf PHC-200 MIVILA $3.39/LB ] §78.00 |CWT, BELLA, 182101
2001bs CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID [NOBD
VANPEENEN $ 37218 744.00 |ENRICC
Ricotta chesse, whole milk, 3 ib. PHC-200 MIVILA $4.39 $ 878.00 |3 LB, MONTENA, 191807
200 ea CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NG RID  INOBID
} VANPEENEN { $ 5.00]5 1,200.00 |MONTENA

SECTION (C) Line items 42 through 45 will be awarded as a "lump sum bid" to one vendor. Vendor must bid on all fine items

2 PHC750 MIVILA 481407, UPSTATE, 191803 / 192008 / 182010/ 182012
assorted yogurf, no fat, - 4 oz, ~ 24/case, Dannon or 750 cases $ 2180 | § ‘18,4_25.00
equal. NO ASPARTANE CREAM-O-LAND NO RID NOBID [NOERID
- VANPEENEN | $ 2208 | $ 16,560.00 |UPSTATE
3 |Greek yogurt, 6oz-12fcs, assor. flavors, Fage PHC-26 MIVILA 5 18801 % 47250 [VARIETY PACK, CHOBANY, 16/5.30Z, 258021
25 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID MO BID |NOBD
e aqual NO ASPARTANE VANPEENEN | § 2004 | $ 501.00 |CHOBAN!
4 Yanilla yogurt - § oz.- 12/case, Dannon of squal PHCAT5C MIVILA $ 87018 852500 12/60Z, C-0-L, 191850
750 cases | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
. NO ASPARTANE VANPEENEN | $§ 8521 % 5,390.00 |LAYOGURT
15 |Assorted yogurt - 6 oz - 12/case, Crowley or equal PHC-2500 MIVILA $ 870§ 2175000 |12/60Z C-O-L.#8
2500 ceses | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO ASPARTANE VANPEENEN | $ 852 | § 21,300.00 |LAYOGURT
=CTION (D) Lina items 46 through 55 will be awarded as 2 "lump sum bid" to one vendor. Vendor must bid on all line items Award is pased on the vendor mark up only,

r ftems 46 through 55. The commodity price

is set monthly by the Federal Government

hitp:ifwww.fmmone.com/ Price__AnnouncementslAdvancefAleﬂ 504.pdi

e
=+ \fandor ynit § - curraht comm.

i Dept. Quantity mark up price uni price Total price

48 11 Gallon whole CH50 MIVILA NO BID NOBID  [NoBD NO BID
50 sach CREAM-O-LAND 1 § 194721 § 1.85281 9% 39019 190.00
VANPEENEN ¥ 4.24721 % 1.85281 % 320 $ 180.00

a7 |12 Galion whole PHC-3100 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3100 each CREAM-O-LAND 122361 09264 | & 2151 % 6,665.00
YANPEENEN 5 097361 6 09264 | $ 1,80 | $ 5,890.00




48 |12 Gallon skim PHC-3200 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NQO BID NO BID

3200 each CREAM-O-LAND 8 12181 $ 05219 | ¢ 175 | $ 5,600.00

. VANPEENEN $ 1.0881 | § 053191 % 1601 % 5,120.00
49 {8 oz, Whole MOW-340000 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

342000 each | CREAM-O-LAND 5 0169 | $ 01158 | & 02848 | § 97,401.80

| CH-2600 VANPEENEN 15 01642 | § 0.4158 | § 02815% 95,760.00
50 |8 oz. Skim PHC-67500 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

130008 each | CREAM-O-LAND 3 01581 % D.0865 | $ 0.2245 | % 28,185.00

| MOW-52400 VANPEENEN | § 01335 $ 00665 ! % 0.201% 26,000.00
51 JBoz2% PHC-{70000 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID

170000 each | CREAM-O-LAND | % 0158018 00984 |$ 0255319 43,401.00

L VANPEENEN $ 04336 | § 0.0964 | $ 0.231 8% 39,100.00
52 |40z, Whole PHC-150000 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

150000 each §  CREAM-C-LAND % 00023 0.0579 | § D.14851 % 22,485.00

e VANPEENEN | $ 04218 | § 0.0482 | $ pA7 | & 25,500.00
53 4oz Skim PHC-100000 MIVILA . NOEID NO BID NO BID NO BID

100000 gach | CREAM-O-LAND $ 009021+ 8 003331 % 012351 % 12,350.00

‘ VANPEENEN | $ 00068 | § 0.0333 (8% 043 & 13,000.00
54 oz 2% RHC-2000C MIVILA NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID

20000 each CREAM-Q-LAND | § 01858 ¢ 3 0.0482 1 % 021381 % 4,278.00

‘ VANPEENEN $ 0.1218 | § 0.0482 | § 017 | $ 3,400.00
55  ]Qt, Butter Mik FHC-100 MIVILA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD

100 each CREAM-O-LAND § § 2.04 - $ 2041% 204.00

VANPEENEN [ $ 4.9800 NIA $ 1991 % 199.00

SECTION (E) Line items 56 through 67 will be awarded as a "lump sum bid” to one vendor.

Vendor must bid on all line itermns

$ 19,850.00 {24/40Z

56 llce Cream, Cheoolate, 4 oz cups, 48 per case PHC- 1000 MIVILA 871151 $ 19.85
1000 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NG BID NO BID
VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 ilce Cream, Vanila, 4 02 cups, 48 per case PHC-1000 MIVILA 871150 % 19.85 | § 19,850.00 \241402
1000 cases | CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NOBID [NOBID
VANPEENEN NO BID NOQO BID NO BID
58 |ice Cream, Diet Vanilla, 4 0z cups, 48 per case PHC-100C MIVILA 871149 $ 19,85 | § 19,850.00 |24402
4000 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID  [NOEBID
509 |lce Cream, Strawberty, 4 oz cups, 48 per case PHC-750 MIVILA 871152 [3 19.85 | 5 14,887.50 |24/40Z
750 cases CREAM-C-LAND NO BID NORBID |NOBID
VANPEENEN NO BID NQ BID  INOBID
80 llce Cream, Sherbert, 4 oz cups, 48 per case PHC-250 MHVILA 871153 [ 19,85 | $ 4,764.00 |241402
240 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
WVANPEENEN NO BID NO BID iNOBID




EE CREAM CONE VANICHOC,

1 liee Cream, Vanila, Cone, 24 per case PHC- 480 MIVILA 874684 $ 2105|%  158.65 1241302, RIGH'S
7TCases | CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NOBID [NOBID
VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 Tce Gream, Chocolate Sundae, 3 oz cups, 48 per PHC- 450 MIVILA 271604 $ 25.85 | §  180.95 [12160Z
7 Cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NORID |NOBID
case VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 llce Cream, Chocolate Eclair, Bar, 24 per case PHC- 450 MIVILA 871607 $ 19.85 | & 4,764.00 {24/30Z, RICH'S
T cases CREAM-O-LAND NG BID NO BID NG BID
— VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID NQ BID o
54 tlce Cream, Vanilla Cruch, Bar, 24 per case PHC-450 MIVILA 871626 s 2785 |$ 19495 lCREAMNé AR, 241302
Teases | GREANFO-LAND NO BID NOBID |NOBID
| VANPEENEN NQ BID NOBID INOBID
a5 Vo Cream, Strawberry Shortcake, Bar, 24 per case PHC- 450 MRAALA 8749625 $ 1985 | § 138.95 [241302, RICH'S
7 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID NQ BID
. VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 lice Cream, Vanilla, Sandwich, 24 per case PHC-450 MIVILA 871685 | § 19.85 | § 4,764.00 |24/30Z, RICH'S
7 cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BiD NO BID
L VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID  [NOEID
57 \lce Cream, Fudge, Bars, 24 per case PHC - 450 MVILA 871642 $ 10.85 | § 4,764.00 |24/30Z RICHS
7 Cases CREAM-O-LAND NO BID NO BID NO BID
VANPEENEN NO BID NO BID NG BID




County of Passaic
Board of County Commissioners

CERTIFICATION OF NON-INVOLVEMENT IN PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN
RUSSIA OR BELARUS

SHORT DESCRIPTION
REQUISITION No./CONTRACT No.

Milk, Dairy Products and Prepared Salads for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions

SB-24-034

Pursuant to N.LS.A. 52:32-60.1, et seq. (L. 2022, ¢. 3) any person or entity (hereinafier “Vendor”) that seeks (o enter into or renew a contract with a State agency.
including a local government agency, for the provision of goods or services, or the purchase of bonds or other obligations, must complete the certification below
indicating whether or not the Vendor is identified on the Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC) Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list,

available here: hitps

sanctionssearch.ofuc. treas.pov/. It the County of Passaic finds that a Vendor has made a certification in violation of the law, it shall take any action

as may be appropriate and provided by law, mle or contract, including but not limited to, imposing sanctions, seeking compliance, recovering damages, declaring the
party in default and seeking debarment or suspension of the party.

CERTIFICATION

L. the undersigned, certfy that [ have read the definition of “Vendor” below, and have reviewed the Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC) Specially Designated

Nationals and Blocked Persons list, and having done so certity:

(Check the Appropriare Box)

A and/or Belarus.

OR

list on account ¢

below,

ivity related to Russia and/or Belarus.

%f‘hat the Vendor is not identified on the OF AC Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list on account of activity related to Russia

B. Thatlam unahlc to certify as to “A™ above, because the Vendor is identified on the OFAC Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons

OR C.  ThatTam unable to certify as to "A™ above, because the Vendor is identified on the OFAC Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked
Persons list. However, the Vendor is engaged in activity related to Russia and/or Belarus consistent with federal law, regulation, license or
exemption. A detailed description of how the Vendor’s activity related to Russia and/or Belarus is consistent with federal law is set forth

7

(Attach Additional Sheets if Necessary.)

3-153Y

Sig ymune(u@lendm s Authorized Repneacutanv

7 U Hermnondez

Date

20— [FRIG 3 F

Print Name and Title of Vendor's Authorized Representative

yawa fopds

Vendor’s FEIN, EIN or FTIN

Vendor's Name

2, Colhy  frenpd

4¥3 273 U

143

Vendor’s Phone Number

@32 IR

433

Vendor’s Address (Street Addresb)

akerson Al (7503

Vendor’s Fax Number

Oid a il o

L (NN

Vendor's Address (City/State/Zip Code)

Definitions:

Vendor means: (1) A natural person, corporation,
business association, sole proprietorship, joint venture,

170Kc)(3) of the International Financial Institutions Act,

company,

Vendor’s Email Address

limited partnership,
partnership, society, trust,

limited liability partnership,

limited liability company,

or any other nongovernmental entity, organization, or
group; (2) Any governmental entity or instrumentality of a government, including a multilateral development institution, as defined in Section

22 US.C. 262r(e)3); or (3) Any parent, successor, s

subsidiary, or any entity under common ownership or control with, any entity described in paragraph (1) or (2).

ubunit, direct or indirect



Mar 16 24 Q7.09a Van Peenen Foods, LLC 2016256340 p.1

County of Passaic pa Ssa i L of
Board of County Commissioners COU NTY

=

CERTIFICATION OF NON-INVOLVEMENT IN PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN
RUSSIA OR BELARUS

SHORT DESCRIPTION  wilk, Dairy Products and Frepared Salads for the Gountly of Passaic Departments and Instiutions
REQUISITION No./CONTRACT No. SB-24-034

Purswant to NJ.S.A. §2:32-60.1, et seq. (.. 2022 c. 3) any person or entity (hereinafter “Vendor™) that secks to enter info or renew a contract with a State agency,
including a local government agency, for the provision of geods or services, or the purchase of bonds or other obligations, must complete the cerification below
indicating whether or not the Vendor is identified on the Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC) Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list,
available here: https:/#sinctionssearch.ofac.treas. gov/. If the County of Passaic finds that a Vendor has made a certification in viclation of the law, it shall take any action
as may be appropriate and provided by law, rule or contract, ncluding but not limited to, imposing sanctions, seeking compliance, recovering damages, declaring the
party in default and seeking debarment or suspension of the party.

CERTIFICATION

1, the undersigned, certify that I have read the definition of “Vendor™ below, and have reviewed the Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC) Specially Designated
Nationals and Blocked Persons list, and having done so certify:

(Check the Appropriate Box}

v/
\-,'/ A, That the Vendor is not identitied on the OTAC Speciallv Desipnated Nationals and Blocked Persons Hst on account of activity selated to Russia
OoRr
B. That I am unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identified on the OF AC Speciallv Designated Nationals and Diocked Persons
list en acecunt of activity related to Russia and/or Belarus.
OR C. That]am unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identified on the OFAC Specially Desirnated Nationals and Blocked
Persons list. However, the Vendor is engaged in activity related to Russia and/or Belarus consistent with federal law, regulation, license or
exemption. A detailed description of how the Vendor’s activity related to Russia and/er Belarus is consistent with federal law is set forth

below.

(Attach Additional Sheets if Necessary.)
\Lk

Signature of Vendor’s Authorized Representative . Date -~ 7 (
o o ) )
ﬂi\-ﬂ\}-’é\\r— \)‘- w\?z»cu.w ‘wvi_uu—»;g( j’]z 331? 3 (,
Print Name and Title of Vendor’s Authorized Repres.entauve Vendor's FEIN, EIN or FTIN (
A -7
ow fazron Crod= W C ot Fob-9 7Y
Vendor’s Name Vendor’s Phone Number '
Py (' -
ML e T ot 63¢7 (3o
Vendor’s Address (Street Addresst Vendor's Fax Number
“\J\J}V\ i hSTANI “JL [bim» (o g b (RS %‘-ﬁ‘“ <
Vendor's Address (City/State/Zip Code) Vendor’s Ema}l Address 1
Definitions:

Vendor means: (1} A natural persorn, corporation, company, limited partnership, limited liability partnership, limited liability company,
business association, sole proprietorship, joint venture, parinership, society, trust, or any other nongovernmental entity, crganization, or
group; (2) Any governmental entity or instrumentalify of a government, including a multilateral development instination, as defined in Section
1701(c)(3)} of the Internationat Financial Institutions Act, 22 US.C. 262r(c}3): or (3) Any parent, successor, subunit, direct or indirect
subsidiary, or any entity under common ownership or control with, any entity described in paragraph (1) or (2).
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	Van Peenen Foods LLC
	Mivila Foods 
	Grand Total: $535,715.86
	Grand Total: $221,757.60



