COUNTY OF PASSAIC
BID TALLY SHEET
Sherry Arvanitakis, Q.P.A. Straight Bids Nadege Allwaters, Esq.
Purchasing Agent County Counsel

Taken by: Hashiah Brown

Taken by: Zyanya Cordova PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
Typed by: Shantiece Durham

Bids received at 10:30 a.m. on November 6. 2025 at the Passaic Countv Procurement Center. 495 River Street Second Floor, Paterson, NJ 07524
SB-26-004 Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions,

Ack Stmt. Non-Coll, | Disc. VA Non-Tnv, Business | Availto
Vendor s

of Corp. Iran | Russia/Belarus | Reg. Cort. | CoOp Bid Total
Addenda Owner
Metropolitan Foods dba
Driscoll Foods 5 17 Items
6 West Belt 2 x b x X L NG $40,385.00
Wayne, NJ 07470
RP Baking, LLC dba

Pechter’s X 43 Items

PO Box 128 * £ - e X B $71,282.01

Northvale, NJ 07647




Form W"' 9

(Rev. March 2024)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

Go to www.irs.gov/FormW3 for instructions and the latest information.

Give form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Before you begin. For guidance related to the purpose of Form W-9, see Purpose of Form, below.

antity's name on line 2.)

RP BAKING LLC

1 Name of entity/individual. An entry is required. {For a sole proprietor or disregarded entity, enter the owner's name on line 1, and enter the business/disregarded

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above.
PECHTER'S

only one of the following seven boxes.

[ individual/sole proprietor D C corporation

box for the tax classification of its owner.
] other (see instructions)

Print or type.

3a Check the appropriate box for federal tax classification of the entity/individual whose name is entered on line 1. Check

I:I S corporation
LLC. Enter the tax classification (C = C corporatien, S = $ corporation, P = Partnership) s % E & P

Note: Check the “LLC" hox above and, in the entry space, enter the appropriate code (C, 8, or P) for the tax
classification of the LLC, unless it is a disregarded entity. A disregarded entity should instead check the appropriate

4 Exemptions (codes apply only to
certain entities, not individuals;

see instructions on page 3):

[ Partnership  [] Trust/estate

Exempt payee code (if any)
Exemption from Foreign Account Tax

Compliance Act (FATCA) reporting
code (if any)

3b If on line 3a you checked "Partnership” or “Trust/estate,” or checked “"LLC" and entered “P" as its tax classification,
and you are providing this form to a partnership, trust, or estate in which you have an ownership interest, check
this box if you have any foreign partners, owners, or beneficiaries. See instructions . .

(Applies to accounts maintained
outside the United States.)

See Specific Instructions on page 3.

6 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.). See instructions.

PO BOX 128

Requester’'s name and address (optional}

6 City, state, and ZIP code
NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

7 List account number(s) here {optional)

Taxpayer ldentification Number (TIN})

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box, The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other v -
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a

TIN, later,

Note: If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. See also What Name and
Number To Give the Requester for guidelines an whose number to enter,

] Social security number

or
Employer identification number |

2|10(-|4|7|1(0|3(8]|3

I  Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and

2.1 am not subject to backup withholding because (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (¢} the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3.l am a U.S. citizen or other LS. person (defined below): and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that 1 am exempt from FATGA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding
because you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interast paid,
acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and, generally, payments
other than interest and dividendsN\you are not required to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN, See the instructions for Part II, later.

Sign Signature A(
Here U.S. person

O

Q

Date l{_]Z"ZORS

General Instructions

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.irs.gov/FormWs.

What’s New

Line 3a has been modified to clarify how a disregarded entity completes
this line. An LLC that is a disregarded entity should check the
appropriate box for the tax classification of its owrier. Otherwise, it
should check the “LLC” box and enter its appropriate tax classification.

New line 3b has been added to this form. A fiow-through entity is
required to complete this line to indicate that it has direct or indirect
foreign partners, owners, or beneficiaries when it provides the Form W-9
to another flow-through entity in which it has an ownership interest. This
change is intended to provide a flow-through entity with information
regarding the status of its indirect foreign partners, owners, or
beneficiaries, so that it can satisfy any applicable reporting
requirements. For example, a partnership that has any indirect foreign
partners may be required to complete Schedules K-2 and K-3. See the
Partnership instructions for Schedules K-2 and K-3 (Form 1065).

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS is giving you this form because they

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W-9 (Rev. 3-2024)




STATE OF NEW JERSEY

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

Taxpayer Name:
Trade Name:

Address:

Certificate Number:

Effective Date:

Date of Issuance:;

RP BAKING LLC

94 DEMAREST MILL ROAD
NANUET, NY 10954-2921

1237002
May 18, 2006
November 06, 2025

For Office Use Only:

20251106153912455




COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Depariments and Institutions
BOARD CF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

STATEMENT OF CORPORATE OWNERSHIP

All parts must be carefully reviewed and completed to the extent applicable,
Any material errors or omissions will vesult in the rejection of a bidder’s entire submission.

(Part I must be completed by all bidders)
1) Full Legal/Corporate Name of Bidder: RP BAKING LLC D/B/A PECHTER'S
(hereafier, “Bidder”)

2) Bidder’s Entity Type (check one):

Corporation

S Corporation

Limited Liability Company
Partnership

Limited Partnership

Limited Liability Partnership
Sole Proprietorship

Other: P

3) Does any individual own a 10% or greater interest in the Bidder? (check one):

Yes
No

4) Does any entity own a 10% or greater interest in the Bidder? (check one):

Yes X

No

5) Does any individual or entity own a 10% or greater interest in an entity described in
Question 4 above? (check one):

Yes
No
Not Applicable

(Pa}f 2 must be completed if Bidder is a Corporation, S Corporation, or Limited Liability Company)

Date of Incorporation: Place of Incorporation: HUDSON
Business Address: PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647
Business Telephone: 973-483-3374 Business Fax: 2/ 9-418-3926

Page 29 of 53



COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT $B-26-004

PART 3A -

(Part 34 must be completed if you answered “Yes” to Part I, Question 3)

In accordance with N.J.S.A. 52:25-24.2, you must provide the legal names and addresses of all individuals holding
a ten percent (10%) or greater interest in the Bidder (i.e., of all stockholders in the corporation who own 10
percent or more of its stock, of any class, or of all individual partners in the partnership who own a 10 percent or
greater interest therein, or of all members in the limited liability company who own a 10 percent or greater interest
therein, as the case may be),

Name: SALVATORE BATTAGLIA
Address: PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

- PHILIP BATTAGLIA
Address: PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

Name: JOSEPH BATTAGLIA
Address: PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

Name: MARIO BATTAGLIA
Address: PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

(Attach additional sheets if necessary)

PART 3B

(Part 3B must be completed if you answered “Yes” to Part 1, Question 4)

In accordance with N.J.S. A. 52:25-24.2, you must provide the legal names and addresses of all entities holding a
ten percent (10%) or greater interest in the Bidder (i.e., if any stockholder or partner or member holding a ten
percent (10%) or greater interest in Bidder is itself a corporation or partnership or limited liability company).

PHILIP BATTAGLIA

Name:
Address: PQ BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647
Name: SALVATORE BATTAGLIA

Address: PO BOX 128 NORTHVALE. NJ Q7647

— JOSEPH BATTAGLIA
Address: PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647
1 s MARIO BATTAGLIA
Address: PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

(Attach additional sheets if necessary)

Page 30 of 53



COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Preducts for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT $B-26-004

PART3C

(Part 3C must be completed if you answered “Yes” to Part I, Question 5)

In accordance with N.J.S.A. 52:25-24.2, you must provide the legal names and addresses of all individuals and
entities holding a ten percent (10%) or greater interest in any entity listed in Part 3B hereinabove,

Name: JOSEPH BATTAGLIA & PHILIP BATTAGLIA
Address: _ PO BOX 128, NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

Name: MARIO BATTAGLIA & SALVATORE BATTAGLIA
Address: _ PO BOX 128 NORTHVALE, NJ 07647

(Aftach additional sheets if necessary)

PART 4",

(Part 4 is optional, and may be completed in lieu of Parts 3B and/or 3C with respect to any publicly
traded entity that is a direct or indirect parent entity of the Bidder)

To comply with N.J.S.A. 52:25-24.2, a bidder with any direct or indirect parent entity which is publicly traded may
subnit;

1) The name and address of each publicly traded entity and the name and address of each person that
holds a 10 percent or greater beneficial interest in the publicly traded entity as of the last annual filing
with the federal Securities and Exchange Commission or the foreign equivalent; and

2) If there is any person that holds a 10 percent or greater beneficial interest, also shall submit links to
the websites containing the last annual filings with the federal Securities and Exchange Commission
or the foreign equivalent and the relevant page numbers of the filings that contain the information on
cach person that holds a 10 percent or greater beneficial interest,

Any response to Part 4 must be provided through separately attached documenti(s) including all
information, website links, and page numbers required by N.J.S.A. 52:25-24.2.

PARTS

(Part 5 must be completed and signed by an individual or behalf of the Bidder)

CERTIFICATION
I, the undersigned, certify that I am authorized to execute this certification on behalf of the Bidder, and that the
foregoing information and any attachments hereto, to the best of my knowledge are true and complete. I
acknowledge that the County of Passaic (“County™) is relying on the information contained herein, and that the
Bidder is under a continuing obligation from the date of this certification through the completion of any contract(s)
with the County to notify the County in writing of any changes to the information contained herein. I am aware that
itis a criminal offense to make a false statement or misrepresentation in this certification. If I do so, I will be subject
to criminal prosecution under the law, and it will constitute a material breach permitting the County to declare any

contract(s) resulting ﬁoﬁ'ﬂj:jrtiﬁcation void ud‘}uﬁ}anforceable.
Signature: Y N@K&L‘f—\ Date: 11/05/2025

Name (please print): DENISE MILLER
Title: (please print): QFF|CE MANAGER
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

BID PROPOSAL

Proposals showing any erasure alteration must be initialed by bidder in ink. Altered items not
initialed will not be considered for award.

Name of Bidder (i.e. Company Name) (Please Print): RP BAKING LLC D/B/A PECHTER'S

submits the following proposal for the
Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
Project SB-26-004

Contract Period: January 1, 2026 through March 31, 2026 with One (1) Three Month Option to
Renew

DELIVERY:

All articles shall be delivered to all Departments and Institutions specified with all charges prepaid, ;
(F.O.B. Destination) in such quantities as ordered by the County of Passaic, which may be greater or f
lesser in amount than herein specified and in case no specific time for delivery is included by the County
of Passaic when the order is given, then such goods must be delivered immediately.

No additional charges will be allowed for any transportation cost resulting from partial shipments made at
the vendor's convenience,

Merchants who substitute commodities or deliver commodities not according to specifications, or who do

not deliver at time specified in the proposal will be classified, as undesirable and their proposals will be
refused in future bidding,

To the Passaic County Board of County Commissioners:

The undersigned hereby declares that they have carefully examined the Bid Documents and that
they will contract to carry out and complete said Project at the following prices:
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROIECT §B-26-004

Total Number of Items Bid Upon: 43

Amount in Words: SEVENTY-ONE THOUSDAND, TWO HUNDRED EIGHTY-T\NO &7.01

Amount in Numbers: $ 71 ,28201

Signature of Authorized Representative: iol?/"r\w, L\L(uu—’"

Name (Please Print or Type): DENISE MILLER

11/05/2025
Title (Please Prinr): OFFICE MANAGER Date: ;
Telephone Number: _ 973-483-3374  EXT. 4204 Fax Number; 973-481-2319

Email Address: dmiller@pechters.com
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Depariments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT $B-26-004

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN

Part 1; Certification

Pursuant to Public Law 2012, ¢. 25, any person or entity that submits a bid or proposal or otherwise proposes to
enter into of renew a contract must complete the certification below to attest, under penalty of perjury, that the person or
entity, or one of the person or entity’s parents, subsidiaries, or affiliates, is not identified on a list created and maintained
by the New Jersey Treasury’s Chapter 25 list as a person or entity engaging in investment activities in Iran,

The Chapter 25 list is found on the State of New Jersey Division of Purchase and Property website at

hitp://www.state nj.us/treasury/purchase/pdf/Chapter25List.pdf. Bidders must review the list prior to completing the

certification below. Failure to complete the certification will render a bidder’s propesal non-responsive.

PLEASE CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX:

v

I certify, pursuant to Public Law 2012, ¢. 25, that neither the bidder listed herein nor any of the bidder’s
parents, subsidiaries, or affiliates is listed on the New Jersey Department of Treasury’s list of entities
determined to be engaged in prohibited activities in Iran pursuant to P.L. 2012, ¢, 25, I further certify
that I am the person listed above, or [ am an officer or representative of the entity listed above and am
authorized to make this certification on its behalf. I will skip Part 2 and sign and complete the
Certification below.

OR

I am unable to certify as above because the bidder and/or one of mote of its parents, subsidiaries, or 1
affiliates is listed on the New Jersey Department of Treasury’s Chapter 25 list, I will provide a detailed,
accurate, and precise description of the activities in Part 2 below and sign and complete the
Certification below. Failure to provide such will result in the proposal being rendered as non-responsive
and appropriate penalties, fines, and/or sanctions will be assessed as provided by law,

Part 2: Please provide further information related to investment activities in Iran.

Relationship to
Name Bidder/Offeror

Description of Activities

Duration of Engagement Anticipated Cessation Date
Bidder/Offeror
Contact Name Contact Phone Number

Certification: I, being duly sworn upon my oath, hereby represent and state that the foregoing information and any
attachments thereto to the best of my knowledge are true and complete. I attest that | am authorized to execute this
certification on behalf of the above referenced person or entity. I acknowledge that Passaic County is relying on the
information contained herein and hereby acknowledge that I am under a continuing obligation from the date of this
certification through the completion of any contracts with the County to notify the County in writing of any changes to the
answers of information contained herein. I acknowledge that I am aware that it is a criminal offense to make a false
statement or misrepresentation in this certification, and if I do so, I recognize that I am subject to criminal prosecution |
under the law and that it will also constitute a material breach of my agreement(s) with Passaic County, New Jersey and
that the County at its option may declare any contract(s) resulting from this certification void and unenforceable.

Name of Bidder (i.e. Company Name) (Please nt).__RP BAKING ,J?LC,‘ D/gff\ PECHTER'S
v £, '
Signature of Authorized Representative: % \(ZA/M

DENISE MILLER

Name (Please Prinf);

Title (Please Print); OFFICE MANAGER Tt 11/05/2025
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC ' Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

CERTIFICATION OF NON-INVOLVEMENT IN PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN
RUSSIA OR BELARUS

Pursuant to N.LS.A. 52:32-60.1, et seq. (L. 2022, ¢, 3) any person or entity (hereinafter “Vendor™) that seeks to enter into or renew a contract with a
State agency, including a local government agency, for the provision of goods or services, or the purchase of bonds or other obligations, must complete
the certification below indicating whether or not the Vendor is identified on the Office of Foreign Asscts Control (OFAC) Specially Designated
Nationals and Blocked Persons list, available here: https;/sanctionssearch.ofac.treas.gov/. [f the County of Passaic finds that a Vendor has made a
certification in violation of the law, it shall take any action as may be appropriate and provided by law, rule or contract, including but not limited to,
imposing sanctions, seeking compliance, recovering damages, declaring the party in default and seeking debarment or suspension of the party,

CERTIFICATION

L, the undersigned, certify that I have read the definition of “Vendor” below, and have reviewed the Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC)
Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list, and having done so certify:

(Check the Appropriate Box}

A.  That the Vendor is not identified on the OFAC Spegially Desipnated Nationals and Blocked Persons list on account of activity
OR related to Russia and/or Belarus.

D B. ThatIam unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identified on the QFAC Specially Designated Natjorals and Blocked
OR Persons list on account of activity related to Russia and/or Belarus.

C.  ThatI am unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identified on the OFAC Specially Designated Nationals and
Blocked Persons list. However, the Vendor is engaged in activity related to Russia and/or Belarus consistent with federal law,
regulation, license or exemption. A detailed description of how the Vendor’s activity related to Russia and/or Belarus is consistent
with federal law is set forth below,

D ' i} QJQ-“(’ (Attach Additional Sheefs if Necessary.)
odbnn_ a AL 11/05/2025

Signature of Vendor's Authorized Representative Date
DENISE MILLER 20 4710383
Print Name and Title of Vendor's Authorized Representative Vendor’s FEIN,EIN, or FTIN
RP BAKING LLC D/B/A PECHTER'S 973 483-3374 EXT 4204
Vendor’s Name (i.e. Company Name) Vendor’s Phone Number
PO BOX 128 973-481-2319
Vendor’s Address (Street Address) Vendor’s Fax Number
NORTHVALE, NJ 07647 dmiller@pechters.com
Vendor’s Address (City/State/Zip Code} Vendor’s Ernail Address
Definitions:

Vendor means: (1) A natural person, corporation, company, limited partnership, limited liability partnership, limited liability company,
business assoclation, sole proprietorship, joint venture, partnership, society, trust, or any other nongovernmental entity, organization, or
group; (2) Any govemmental entity or instrumentality of a government, including a multilateral development institution, as defined in
Section 1701{c)3} of the International Financial Institutions Act, 22 U.S.C, 262r(c)(3); or (3) Any parent, successor, subunit, direct or
indirect subsidiary, or any entity under common owttership or control with, any entity deseribed in paragraph (1) or (2)
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. W-9

(Rev. March 2024)

Department of the Treasury
internal Revenue Service

_ Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification
Go to www.irs.gov/FormW3 for Instructions and the latest Information.

Give form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Before you begin, For guldance related to the purpose of Form W-9, seePuipdsa of Form, below.

enlity's name on lin

1 Name of entity/Individual, An entry is required. {For a sole proprietor or disregarded entity, anter the owner's name on line 1, and enter the business/disregarded

M&T/" 2 ‘%(’- g 1—4—/!} foobs TN

2 Bugindss s Jdlaregarded entity name, If différent from above,

DBA Driscelt F£oods

ohly one of the following seven boxes.

[} wdividuai/sale proprietor

box for the tax classilicatlon of its owner,
[ otaer {see instructions)

I:I G corporation Eérporaﬁon [:} Parinership [:] Trust/estate

[:! L1.C. Enter the tax classification {C = C corporation, S = S comporation, P = Partnership)

Note: Check the "LLC" box abova and, in the entry space, enler the appropriate code (C, 8, or P) for the tax
elassification of the LLG, Unless it Is a disregarded entity. A disregarded entity should instead check the appropriate | Exemptlon from Foreign Account Tax

"3a Gheck the appropriate box for federal tax classiflcation of the entltyfindividual whose name is entared on fine 1. Check | 4 Exemptions {codes apply only to

certaln entities, not individuals;
sge Instructions on page 3):

Exempt payee code {if any)

Campllance Act (FATCA] reporting
cods {if any)

3b If on ling 3a you checked “Partnership” or “Trus/estate," or checked "LLC" and entered "P* as its tax classification,
and you are providing this form to & pannership, trust, or estale in which you have an ownership interest, check
this box if you have any {oreign pariners, owners, o benaficlaries. See Instructions . s 8 & ® & .

{Applles to accounts malntained
outside the United States.)

{58 Addréss-{nsmber, stivel, and apt. or suite no.). See Instructions.

WeeT Bel T

Print or type
See Specific Instructions on page 3.

Requester's name and address [optional)

B City, stale, and ZIP code

wWiavae NI o074 70

7  List account numbser(s) here {optional)

Taxpayer ldentification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the approprlate box. The TiN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withnolding, For Individuals, this Is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole propristor, or disregarded entity, see the Instructions for Part |, later. For other
entitles, it is your employer identlfication number (EIN}, If you do not have a number, see How lo gef a

TIN, Jater,

Note: if the account is In more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. See also What Name and
Number To Give the Requester for guidelines an whose number to enter,

Soclal sequrity number

or
Employer identiflcation number

202 [3ldlelalplvlo

Certification

Under penaltles of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer Identification number (or | am waiting for 2 number to be Issued to m_e): and
2, | am not subject to backup withholding because (a) | am sxerpt from, backup withholding, or (b) | have not been netified by tite Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that 1'am subject to backup wititholding as a-result'el a failure to report alt interest or dividends, or (¢}the IRS has natilled me that | am

no longer subject to backup withhelding; and
3.1am a U.S, citizen or other U.S. person {defined below); and

4. The FATCA codels) entered on this form {if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding
because you have falled to report all Interest and dividends on your tax retum, For real estate transagtions, item 2 doss not apply. For mortgage interest paid,
acquishion or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributicns 1o an individual retirerent arrangement (IRA), and, generally, payments

gther than intergst

Sign }@rﬁg of
Here /] U8, porsgp

red to sign the certlfication, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the Instructions for Part Hl, later.

Gengral Ins ions
Section refarences are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwlse
notad.

Future developments. For the latest Information about developments
refated fo Form W-8 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go o www.lrs.gov/FormWea.

What's New

Line 3a has been modified to clarify how a disregarded entity completes
this line. An LLC that is a disregarded entity should check the
appropriate box for the tax classiication of its owner, Otherwiss, it
should check the "LLG" box and enler Its appropriate tax classlfication.

Date ?,Lé/ oS

New line 3b has been added to this form. A flow-through entity is
required lo.cohiplte this.line toindicate that it has direct or indirest
forelgn pariners, ewners, or beneticlarles when'lt prévides the Form W-9
to another fiow-throtigh -entity in'whick it has anownership Interast. This
change is Intended to provide a flow-through entlty with information
regarding the-status-of its indirectforsign partners, ownars; of
bandfliciariés, sothat it can satisfy any applicablereporting
requifemants. Forexampla, a parinership tiat-hiasisny indiregt forelgn
parthers may be requlred-to complete Schadules K-2 and -3, See.the
PaRngrship. Instractions for Schedules K-2;and 1€-3 (Form 1085}

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity {Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
[fifarmetion return with the IRS is giving you this form because they

Cat. No. 16231X

Form W-9 (Rev, 3-2024)



STATE OF NEW JERSEY
BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE

Taxpayer Name: METROPOLITAN FOODS, INC.
Trade Name: DRISCOLL FOODS
Address: 6 WESTBELT
WAYNE, NI 07470
Certificate Number: 0085418
Effective Date: April 30, 1998
Date of Issuance: November 10, 2025

For Office Use Only:
20251110153355223




COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Depariments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT §B-26-604

STATEMENT OF CORPORATE OWNERSHIP

All paris must be carefully reviewed and completed to the extent applicable.
Any material ervors or omissions will result in the rejection of a bidder’s entire submission.

PART 1

(Part 1 must be completed by all bidders)
1) Full Legal/Corporate Name of Bidder: o iyzn/don Feedfs Rk D pdl Frod <
’ (hereafter, “Bidder™)

2) Bidder’s Entity Type (check one):

Corporation

S Corporation ;./T
Limited Liability Company
Partnership

Limited Partnership

Limited Liability Partnership
Sole Proprietorship
Other:

3) Does any individual own a 10% or greater interest in the Bidder? (check one):

Yes
No

4) Does any entity own a 10% or greater interest in the Bidder? (check one):

Yes
No

5) Does any individual or entity own a 10% or greater interest in an entity described in
Question 4 above? {check one):

Yes

No

Not Applicable V]

PART 2

(Part 2 must be completed if Bidder is a Corporation, S Corporation, or Limited Liability Company)

Date of Incorporation: 91 & Place of Incorporation: _4/z,,! .:}l;?f‘?f;xi,’ o
7
Business Address: fr (152 ;?—i:b% / +

iL }z“?“}fﬁ’{ i MT 0900

Business Telephone: {?: A ;{}f"“f;;{ AL £33 Business Fax:
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Depariments and Instilutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

PART 3A

(Part 34 must be completed if you answered “Yes” to Part I, Question 3)

In accordance with N.J.8.A. 52:25-24.2, you must provide the legal names and addresses of all individuals holding
a ten percent (10%) or greater interest in the Bidder (i.e., of all stockholders in the corporation who own [0
percent or more of its stock, of any class, or of all individual partners in the partnership who own a 10 percent or
greater interest therein, or of all members in the limited liability company who own a 10 percent or greater interest
therein, as the case may be).

Name: 7 D, AECH IS
Address: 5!} (/?rff{ va i A
Hlesrdle) Le. . 4T E7 77

Name:
Address:

Name:
Address:

Name:
Address:

(Attach additional sheels if necessary)

PART 3B

(Part 3B must be completed if you answered “Yes” to Part 1, Question 4)

In accordance with N.J,8.A. 52:25-24.2, you must provide the legal names and addresses of all entities holding a
ten percent (10%) or greater interest in the Bidder (i.c., if any stockholder or parlner or member holding a ten
percent (10%) or greater interest in Bidder is itself a corporation or partnership or limited liability company}.

Name:
Address:

Name:
Address:

Name:
Address:

Name:
Address:

(Attach additional sheets if necessary)
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Praducts for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

PART 3C J

In accordance with N.J.S.A. 52:25-24.2, you must provide the legal names and addresses of all individuals and
entities holding a ten percent (10%) or greater interest in any entity listed in Part 3B hereinabove.

(Part 3C must be completed if you answered “Yes” to Part I, Question 5)

Name:
Address:

Name:
Address:

(Attach additional sheels if necessary)

PART 4

(Part 4 is optional, and may be completed in lieu of Parts 3B and/or 3C with respect to any publicly
traded entity that is a direct or indirect parent entity of the Bidder)

To comply with N.I.S.A. 52:25-24.2, a bidder with any direct or indirect parent entity which is publicly traded may
submit:

1) The name and address of each publicly traded entity and the name and address of each person that
holds a 10 percent or greater beneficial interest in the pubticly traded entity as of the last annual filing
with the federal Securities and Exchange Commission or the foreign equivalent; and

2} If there is any person that holds a [0 percent or greater beneficial interest, also shall submit links to
the websites containing the last annual filings with the federal Securities and Exchange Commission
ot the foreign equivalent and the relevant page numbers of the filings that contain the information on
each person that holds a 10 percent or greater beneficial interest.

Any response to Part 4 must be provided through separately attached document(s) including all
information, website links, and page numbers required by N.J.S.A. 52:25-24.2,

PART S

(Part 3 must be completed and signed by an individual on behalf of the Bidder)

CERTIFICATION
I, the undersigned, certify that I ;'n authorized to execute this certification on behalf of the Bidder, and that the
foregoing information andfany dttachments hereto, to the best of my knowledge are true and complete. 1
acknowledge that the Counfty of Passaic (“County™) is relying on the information contained herein, and that the
Bidder is under a continuing obligation from the date of this certification through the completion of any contract(s)
with the County to notify tHe Cointy in writing of any changes to the information contained herein. I am aware that
it is a criminal offense to mpke 7 false statement or misrepresentation in this certification. If T do s, I will be subject
to criminal prosecution under e law, and it will constitute a material breach permitting the County to declare any
contract(s) resulting from tht/qsr_tiﬁgation void and unenforceable.

Signature:
Name (please print); /72#?7 "Drsdpif
Title: (please print): " rpe i/ le it

Date: fﬂt;fﬂﬂ% f/-;?»'“;’
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Depariments and Institations
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

EID PROPOSAL

Proposals showing any erasure alteration must be initialed by bidder in ink. Altered items not
initizled will not be considered for award.

Name of Bidder (i.e. Company Name) (Please Print):ji‘é{ Hn {;’}?f?‘ffr; 0 feads L}}/}x, ; \}/ Slaf/ f;auifg

submits the following proposal for the
Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
Project SB-26-004

Contract Period: January 1, 2026 through March 31, 2626 with One (1) Three Month Option to
Renew

All articles shall be delivered to all Departments and Institutions specified with all charges prepaid,
(F.O.B. Destination) in such quantities as ordered by the County of Passaic, which may be greater or
lesser in amount than herein specified and in case no specific time for delivery is included by the County
of Passaic when the order is given, then such goods must be delivered immediately.

No additional charges will be allowed for any transpottation cost resulting from partial shipments made at
the vendor's convenience.

Merchants who substitute commodities or deliver commodities not according to specifications, or who do
not deliver at time specified in the proposal will be classified, as undesirable and their proposals will be
refused in future bidding.

To the Passaic County Board of County Commissioners:

The undersigned hereby declates that they have carefully examined the Bid Documents and that
they will contract to carry out and complete said Project at the following prices:
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

j

Total Number of Items Bid Upon: e ysr A"J;Zi.s’“l
Amount in Words: %&*1[\;‘ “,.Eﬁ“?r‘é_é‘ <l "}{EH?“/{‘/{ aVi?i’f{fg a’“’ii}‘;}‘A’ ’?(}%M‘ C;‘ﬂﬁl{’“ﬂ-g 1 fﬁ Ng Cér ?7{3

| A f !
Amount in Numbers: $§_H(5, 25 £ £ / /

4
#
Signature of Authorized Representative: _I,//’" ”

5

Name (Please Print or Type): __ | if}] F}/ wisconl!

[ . wn o B
Title (Please Print): __jé_gﬂ(y_ Sictass }'{ Date: F‘-{’;{Qﬁ/{‘?ﬁi’)
Telephone Number:; _"}Fff o o 4y %8, Fax Number:

Email Address: e.”j noef @ {fjl'f“!-\.‘f)'(?{?ilf[ J?n"* N 0l
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Instilutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

DISCLOSURE OF INVESTMENT ACTIVITIES IN IRAN

Part 1: Certification

Pursuant to Public Law 2012, ¢, 25, any person or entity that submits a bid or proposal or otherwise proposes to
enler into or renew a contract must complete the certification below to attest, under penalty of perjury, that the person or
entity, or one of the person or entity’s parents, subsidiaries, or affiliates, is not identified on a list created and maintained
by the New Jersey Treasury’s Chapter 25 list as a person or entily engaging in investment activities in fran,

The Chapter 25 list is found on the State of New Jersey Division of Purchase and Property website at
httpy//www stale nj.us/treasury/purchase/pdi/Cha ter251istpdf. Bidders must review the list prior to completing the
certification below, Failure to complete the certification will render a bidder's proposal non-responsive.

ELEASE CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX:

B/ I certify, pursuant to Public Law 2012, c. 25, that neither the bidder listed herein nor any of the bidder’s
parents, subsidiarics, or affiliates is listed on the New Jersey Department of Treasury’s list of entitics
determined to be engaged in prohibited activities in Iran pursuant to P.L. 2012, c. 25. I further cetify
that I am the person listed above, or I am an officer or representative of the entity listed above and am
authorized to make this certification on its behalf. T will skip Part 2 and sign and complete the
Certification below,

OR

D T am unable to certify as above because the bidder and/or one of more of its parents, subsidiaries, or
affiliates is listed on the New Jersey Department of Treasury’s Chapter 25 list. T will provide a detailed,
accurate, and precise description of the activities in Part 2 below and sign and complete the
Certification below. Failure to provide such will result in the proposal being rendered as non-responsive
and appropriate penalties, fines, and/or sanctions will be assessed as provided by law.

Part 2; Please provide further information related to investment activities in Iran.

Relationship to
Name Bidder/Offeror
Description of Activities
Duration of Engagement Anticipated Cessation Date
Bidder/Offeror
Contact Name Contact Phone Number

Certification: I, being duly sworn upon my oatly, hergby represent and state that the foregoing information and any
altachments thercto to the best of my knowledgg are tfue and complete. | attest that [ am authorized to execute this
certification on behalf of the above referenced person/ar entity. I acknowledge that Passaic County is relying on the
information contained herein and hereby acknpwledge that I am undora continuing obligation from the date of this
certification through the completion of any contracts with the County to notify the County in writing of any changes to the
answers of information contained herein. I adkna ‘Edgc that I am aware that it is a criminat offense to make 2 false
statement or misrepresentation in this certifi Z and if I do so, I recognize that I am subject to criminal prosecution
under the Jaw and that it will also constitute h rfaterial breach of my agreement(s) with Passaic County, New Jersey and
that the County at its option may declare an ontract(s) resulting from this certification void and unenforceable.

Name of Bidder (i.e. Company Name) (e Z:m«-,%-m-;mz;-;‘—{-w Fecrbs  DEa Driseos! Focel s

Signature of Authorized Representative:

™=,
Name (Picase Print): T ;113 Dyrisceo/f

Title (Please Printy: i 1 €54 10 1714~ Date: / C‘/ a3 i/ 255
7 [
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COUNTY OF PASSAIC Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PROJECT SB-26-004

CERTIFICATION OF NON-INVOLVEMENT IN PROHIBITED ACTIVITIES IN
RUSSIA OR BELARUS

Pursuant to N.J.S.A. 52:32-60.1, et seq. (L_2022 c 3) any person or entity (hereinafter “Vendor”) that seeks to enter into or renew a contract with a
State agency, including a local government agency, for the provision of goods or services, or the purchase of bonds or other obligations, must compiete
the certification below indicating whether or not the Vendor is identified on the Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC) Specially Designated
Nationals and Blocked Persons list, avaifable here: hétps Hsanctionssearch.o fac treas.oov/, Ifthe County of Passaic finds that a Vendor has made a

cerlifcation in violation of the faw, it shall take any action as may be appropriate and provided by law, rule or contract, including but not limited to,

imposing sanctions, seeking compliance, recovering damages, declaring the party in default and secking debarment or suspension of the party.

CERTIFICATION

1, the undersigned, certify that [ have read the definition of “Vendor”
Specially Designated Nationals and Blocked Persons list, and having

below, and have reviewed the Office of Foreign Assets Control (OFAC)
done so certify:

(Check the Appropriaie Box)

A. That the Vendor is not identified on the OFAC Speciallv Desisnaled Nationals and Biocked Persons list on
related o Russia and/or Belarus,
OR

account of activity

D B. ThatIam unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identificd on the QFAC

Specially Designaied Nationals and Rlacked
OR Persons Hst on account of activity related ta Russia andfor Belarus,

D C.  That I am unable to certify as to “A” above, because the Vendor is identified on the OF
Blocked Peysons 1ist. However, the Vendor is engaped in activity
idense or exemption, A detaifed descri

kaw is set forth befow.

AC Specially Designated Nationals and
refated to Russia and/or Belarus consistent with foderal law,
ption of how the Vendor’s activity related to Russia and/or Belarus i consistent

/ M (Attach Additional Sheets if Necessary.)
/ (O3] 25
Signature of Vcnd?’s Authorized REprésentative Date i ;

T Dufscoll Dresiclen ¢ 22 - ANFIAY Y

Print Name and Title of Vendor's Authorized Representative Vendor's FEIN,EIN, or FTIN
p e O o e i e O34 A
Medenpnldpn Yordds Dy, Deacril Frols @13~ L73-945HD
Vendor's Name (i-c. Company Name)

Vendor’s Phone Number -

e ibpathe i d

Vendor's Address {Street Address) Vendor’s Fax Number ]
TRTa BV, T 0470 dneel & Arigcsi Ged S - o
Vendot's Address (City/State/Zip Code) ‘

Vendor’s Email Address

Definitions;

Vendor means: (1) A natural person, corporation, company, limited partnership, limited liability partnership, limited liability company,
business association, sole proprietorship, joint venture, parmership, society, trust, or any other nongovernmental entity, organization, or
group; (2) Any governmental entity or instrumentality of a government, including a multilateral development institution, as defined in
Section 1701(c)(3) of the International Financial Tnstimtions Act, 22 US.C. 262r(c)(3); or (3) Any parent, sticcessor, subunit, direct or
indirect subsidiary, or any entity under commion ownership or control with, any entity described in paragraph (1) or (2)
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$B-26-004 BREAD PRODUCTS MASTER SPREADSHEET FOR THE COUNTY OF PASSAIC
Contract Pericd: January 1, 2026 through March 31, 2026 with One (1) Three Month Option to Renew

FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF: Bread for Preakness Healthcare Center, Camp Hope, Office on Aging and other County Departments and Insfitutions

All quantities listed are esfimates, they may be increased or decreased in any amount. Preakness Healthcare Center will require six
Items not on the bid will not be paid. When items are discontinued and substitutes are accepted, the Coun

6) day delive

"OR EQUAL" products will require the

is entitled to a discounted price, if a

This proposal is your price for each item awarded and delivered as per the specification on a line item basis.

licable. When this occurs, the County nesd

s to be notified (in writin

of the new

Preakness Healthcare Center-—-—(PHC), ng Hope—--(CH}

All Bread items must be stamped with the Bakery's date ¢ de-{i.e. each indiv. loaf, carton, pack etc.) Day old bread will not be accepted.
ITEM DESCRIPTION Specification Dept Quan, Vendor Product ID. Unit Price Total Price Comments
1 Frankfurter rolls Sliced 12's PHC-240 250
RP BAKING dba
o = E .0
CH-10 pkgs PECHTER'S 0183-01 $2.34 $585,00
2 Hot dog rclls PC individually PHC-150 150
RP BAKING dba
.00
wrapped 100/case cases PECHTER'S 0183-05 $2.70 $405.0
3 Hamburger rolls Sliced 12's PHG-2500 260
RP BAKING dba
H- - : 8.
CH-10 pkgs i 0184-01 $2.34 $608.40
4 Hamburger rolls PC individually PHC-150 150
RP BAKING dba
- ; 5.
wrapped 100/case cases PECHTER'S 0184-04 $2.70 $405.00
5 Wheat hamburger Sliced 12's PHC-125 125
RP BAKING dba
4 .25
buns pkgs . PECHTER'S 1403-01 $2.49 $311.2
6 White bread Pullman # 3, 24 oz., | PHC-2990 3000
RP BAKING dba
i ! - £ 450.00
30 slices/loaf CH-10 loaves PEGHTER'S 0243-01 $2.15 $6,450.0
7 Rye bread 11b., sliced PHC- 430 500
RP BAKING dba
CH-10 loaves PEGHTER'S 2251-01 $2.20 $1,100.00
8 French Sticks each CH-25 25
RP BAKING dba
2.05 51.25
loaves PECHTER'S 0108-01 $ $
9 Marble loaf #380 CH-10 10
RP BAKING dba
loaves PECHTER'S 0042-01 $5.76 $57.60
10 Raisin bread 11b., 16 slicesfloaf | PHC-100 105
RP BAKING dba
CH-& loaves PECHTER'S 0146-01 $4.15 $435.75
11 Wheat bread Pullman # 4, 24 oz., | PHC-3000 3000
3 RP BAKING dba
- 6 .
28 slices/loaf loaves PECHTER'S 0244-01 $2.15 $6,450.00
12 Steak roll 5" Pecther's GT roll PHC-625 625
RP BAKING dba
| " = # .00
Must be fresh baked or equal dozen PECHTER'S 0246-02 $6.00 $3,750.0




13 Dinner rolis Sliced, 24 pc. PHC-3990 4000
RP BAKING dba :
CH- 10 dozen PECHTER'S 0452-01 $3.19 $12,760.00 16/Pk Not Sliced
14 Italian bread 20 slicefloaf PHC-50 50
RP BAKING dba
loaves PEGHTER'S 0084-01 $4.39 $219.50
15 Pita bread 6", 6/pkg PHG-20 20
RP BAKING dba
packs PECHTER'S 0174-01 $4.25 $85.00
16 Chocolate frosted 12/pkg PHC-12 16
RP BAKING dba
donuts CH-4 dozen PECHTER'S 0204-01 $8.94 $143.04 Dozen
17 P.C. White bread Individually wrapped| PHC-50 50
RP BAKING dba
100 ct cases PECHTER'S 0243-04 $16.04 $802.00 100/Box
18 P.C. Wheat bread Individually wrapped | PHC-750 750
RP BAKING dba
o 4 030,
100 ct cases PECHTER'S 0244-04 $16.04 $12,030.00 100/Box
19 P.C. Rye bread Individually wrapped | PHC-375 375
RP BAKING dba
E i 3 00,
100 ct cases PEGHTER'S 0023-09 $16.04 $6,015.00 100/Box
20 P.C. ltalian bread Individually wrapped| PHC-150 150
RP BAKING dba
100ct cases PECHTER'S 0084-04 $16.76 $2,514.00 100/Box
21 P.C. Dinner rolls Individually wrapped | PHC-750 750
RP BAKING dba
100 ct cases PECHTER'S 0121-03 $3.52 $2,640.00 Dozen
22 Assorted Denuts 8 pack., 16 oz. pkg PHC-12 5 12(m NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID
oz
23 Assorted fresh 12/pkg PHC-18 21
RP BAKING dba
baked donuts CH3 dozen PECHTER'S 0593-01 $8.94 $187.74 Dozen
24 | Assorted fresh baked 12/pkg PHC-18 21
v 5 RP BAKING dba
06- 16 92,32
danish pastries Cha dozen PECHTER'S 0806-01 $1 $2 Each
25 Assorted fresh baked 12/pkg PHC-38 38
gl - . RP BAKING dba :
mini-danish pastries dozen PECHTER'S 0499-01 $13.46 $511.48 DOZEN-2DZ/BOX
26 Fresh baked large 3-4 oz. PHC-7 8
g RP BAKING dba
- 93.
croissants CH-1 dozen PECHTER'S 0300-01 $11.66 $93.28 Dozen
27 Fresh baked small 2 0z, PHC-5 5
crolssants dozen R ERIND din 0262-01 $11.67 $58.35 Dozen

PECHTER'S




28 Fresh baked bagels 3-4 0z, PHC-7 8
RP BAKING dba PLAIN, CINNAMON, ONION,
CH-1 dozen PECHTER'S 0125-02 $4.10 $32.80 SESAME
29 | Fresh baked cupcakes 12/pkg PHC-280 100
RP BAKING dba 0231-01
CH-10 Hozen PECHTER'S 023301 YeED 388000 ROZEN:2DZ/B0X
30 Jumbo muffins 50z. PHC-7 8
RP BAKING dba .
CH-1 dozen PECHTER'S 0844-01 $14.11 $112,88 ASS'D UNWRAPPED/DOZEN
3 Mini Italian pastries 12/pkg FHC-12 14
RP BAKING dba -
CH-2 dozen PEGCHTER'S 054-01 $16.26 $227.64 ASS'D DOZEN
32 Kaiser or Pan roll 12/pkg PHC-130 140
RP BAKING dba
CH-10 dozen PECHTER'S 0583-02 $3.65 $511.00 Dozen
33 Assorted layer cake 10 inch PHC-10 14
RP BAKING dba
32, 448,
i cakes PECHTERG $32.07 $448,98 EACH
34 Scones, assorted 12/pkg PHC-5 5
RP BAKING dba
flavors dozen PECHTER'S $16.04 $80.20 Dozen
35 Cookie tray 2 pound PHC-15 15
RP BAKING dba .
trays PECHTER'S 06815-01 $6.60 $99.00 1LB COOKIE ASS'D TRAY
36 Made to order sheet
cake
a) 1/4 sheet Buttercream icing, PHC-3 3
! RP BAKING dba
.86
standard filling sheets PECHTER'S 0441-01 $65.62 $196,
b) 1/2 sheet Buttercream icing, PHC-5 5
. RP BAKING dba
standard filling sheeets PECHTER'S 0442-01 $79.50 $397.50
¢) Full sheet Buttercream icing, FHC-3 4
5 RP BAKING dba
standard filling CHA sheets PECHTER'S 0443-01 $175.00 $700.00
37 Mini-donuts assorted 2 oz. PHC-25 25
RP BAKING dba
dozen PECHTER'S 0924-01 $17.49 $437.25 PRE-ORDER 24/BOX
38 Mini-muffins assarted 2 oz. PHC-25 25
RP BAKING dba
dozen PECHTER'S 0490-01 $11.00 $275.00
39 Mini-danish 2oz |_PHC-25 | . 23 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ozen
40| -Honey:dipnsd:sticks g Ehies 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

dozen




a1 Apple fritters 6 oz. PHC-3 3
RP BAKING dba
dozen PECHTER'S 0585-01 $8.94 $26.85
42 Cake style denuts 4 oz. PHC-12 12 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
assorted dozen
43 3' Italian Hero each PHC-4 4
RP BAKING dba
loaves PECHTER'S 0631-01 $10.04 $40.16
44 Irish Seda Bread Individually PHC-1650 1650
Birer i wrapped pieces R*;Eés!r"é%gb“ 0576-02 $4.32 $7,128.00 Dozen
45 Irish Soda Bread each PHC-55 55
. RP BAKING dba
Solid loaves PECHTER'S 0082-01 $4.42 $243.10
46 Black & White Cookie | Individually wrapped | PHG-21 21
Traditional dozen
Black/\White,
Red/MWhite RP BAKING dba
(Seasonal) and PECHTER'S - yau50 e
Green/White
(Seasonal)
METRO FOODS dba J&J Snack #3328 CHURRO
932910 $95.40 $95.40
W CINN. 0CT
a7 | Cinnamon Sugar PHC-125 125 fsety T AR
Churra pieces
48 Hot Cross Buns 12/pkg PHC-18 18
RP BAKING dba
Hozen PECHTER'S 0214-01 $15.08 $271.44
Al

Bread items must be stamped with the Bakery's date code-(i.e. each indiv. loaf, carton, pack etc.) Day old bread will not be accepted.

Total number of items bid upon:

Total amount of bid $:

BIDDERS PLEASE SUBMIT ORIGINAL AND TWO (2) COPIES




VENDOR

SB-26-004 WINNING LINE ITEM

METROPOLITAN FOODS
dba DRISCOLL FOODS

47

RP BAKING LLC dba
PECHTER'S

1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15_16.
17,18, 19, 20, 21, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30,
31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36a, 36b, 36¢, 37, 38, 41, 43,
44, 45, 46, 48
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County of Passaic
Board of County Commissioners

OFFICE OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 401 Grand Street
Paterson, New Jersey 07505

Director Pasquale "Pat" Lepore Tel: 973-881-4402
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Matthew P. Jordan, Esq.
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Nadege D. Allwaters, Esq.
County Counsel
Louis E. Imhof, RMC
Clerk Of The Board

Agenda: RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AN AWARD OF CONTRACT TO RP BAKING, LLC
D/B/A PECHTER’S TO PROVIDE BREAD PRODUCTS TO PREAKNESS HEALTHCARE

CENTER, PURSUANT TO N.I.S.A. 40A:11-4 ET SEQ. AND SB-24-001

THIS RESOLUTION WAS REQUESTED BY:
PREAKNESS HEALTHCARE CENTER

REVIEWED BY:
BT
P Official Resolution#

Matthew P. Jordan, Esq. Meeting Date 11/21/2023
Introduced Date 11/17/2023
Adopted Date

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY:
Agenda Item 42.

4-01-27-172-001-F04

\_M@Z&(ﬂ@ Lees CAF#

Purchase Req. #

Nadege D. Allwaters, Esq.

Result

Health and Human Services
COMMITTEE NAME




RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AN AWARD OF CONTRACT TO RP BAKING, LLC D/B/A
PECHTER’S TO PROVIDE BREAD PRODUCTS TO PREAKNESS HEALTHCARE CENTER,
PURSUANT TO N.J.S.A. 40A:11-4 ET SEQ. AND S$B-24-001

WHEREAS, the County of Passaic (“County”) is a body politic and corporate pursuant to
N.J.S.A. 40:18-1 and vested with all rights contained therein; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to N.JS.A. 40:20-1, the Board of County Commissioners of the

County of Passaic (“Board”) is vested with managing the property, finances, and affairs of the
County; and

WHEREAS, Preakness Healthcare Center (“Preakness™ is a New Jersey Department of
Health licensed, 406-bed skilled nursing facility that is owned and operated by the Board; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to N.JSA. 40A:11-4, et seq, for every contract awarded by the
County for the provision or performance of any goods or services, the cost of which in the aggregate
exceeds the bid threshold established pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-3, shall be awarded by resolution

of the Board to the lowest responsible bidder afier public advertising for bids and bidding thereof:
and

WHEREAS, on August 23, 2023, the Passaic County Purchasing Agent issued SB-24-001,
Bread Products for the County of Passaic Departments and Institutions (“5B-24-001") in compliance
with NJSA. 40A:11-4, et seq., that solicited competitive pricing from qualified vendors for the
goods and services sought therein; and

WHEREAS, RP Baking, LLC d/b/a Pechter's is the lowest responsible bidder to SB-24-001, as
evidenced by the tally sheet attached hereto and made part of this Resolution; and

WHEREAS, the Executive Director of Preakness is recommending to award a contract to
RP Baking, LLC d/b/a Pechter’s to provide bread products to Preakness for calendar year 2024, in an
amount mnot to exceed two hundred fifiy-two thousand mnine hundred ninety-four dollars and
sixty-five cents ($252,994.65), with one year option to be exercised at the discretion of the Board;
and

WHEREAS, fiunds are available in Account No. 4-01-27-172-001-F04, or any other account
that may be deemed appropriate by the Chief Financial Officer or his designee, and the availability
of funds has been contingently certified by the Chief Financial Officer subject to sufficient funds
being appropriated by the Board in the 2024 andfor subsequent County budget(s), which is attached
to and made part of this Resolution; and

WHEREAS, this matter was discussed at the November 8, 2023, Health, and Human Services
Committee meeting, and is being recommended to the Board for approval; and

NOW, THEREFORE, LET IT BE RESOLVED, pursuant to N.J.S.A 40A:11-4, the
Board of County Commissioners of the County of Passaic hereby authorizes a contract award to RP
Baking, LLC dfb/a Pechter’s to provide bread products to Preakness Healthcare Center for calendar
year 2024, in an amount not to exceed two hundred fifty-two thousand nine hundred ninety-four
dollars and sixty-five cents ($252,994.65), with one year option to be exercised at the diseretion of
the Board, in accordance with the terms and conditions set forth in SB-24-001.

LET IT BE FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Clerk of the Board, County Counsel, Purchasing

Agent, Executive Director of Preakness, and Director of the Board are authorized to take any action
necessary to carry out the purpose of this Resolution.

SF November 21, 2023



CERTIFICATION OF AVAILABLE FUNDS

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT FUNDS ARE AVAILABLE AS FOLLOWS

AMOUNT: $252,994 65
APPROPRIATION: *Contingent upon availability of funds in 2024
adopted budget
PURPOSE:

Award contract to RP Baking, LLC d/b/a Pechter’s to

provide bread products to Preakness Healthcare
Center.

(VN Y

Erin Moonéy, Tﬂ’-easurer

DATED: November 21,2023



